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Flood Simulation Objective 

Develop estimated flood stage 
polygons that estimate the extent of 
inundated areas as the Charles River 
rises in half-foot increments. 

The source of water for this flood is 
assumed to be the river.  Land area 
remains dry until connected to the 
river by the flood.  Depressions are not 
filled until water rises above 
intervening landforms.  

The attribute table for the polygon 
layer is shown on the right.  The 
Elevatioon field denotes the height of 
the water at each flood stage. 

2D and 3D feature classes were 
produced. 



Surface Development 

All of the estimations are based on a 
survey provided by the client.  The data 
are based on a 2010 photogrametric 
survey conducted by InfoTech.  
According to their documentation, 
their elevations are based on the North 
American Vertical Datum of 1988.   

Masspoints, Spot Elevations Contours 
and Breaklines were intepolated using 
the ESRI CreateTIN tool. The TIN was 
converted to a raster with a 1 Foot cell 
resolution. 

The procedure is recorded in the 
CreateFullTin model provided in the 
Tools Folder.   



Flood Model 

The model begins by locating the areas 
of the terrain surface that to not drain 
into the river.  These areas do not flood 
until they are connected to the river by 
the flood.   

 

Masspoints, Spot Elevations Contours 
and Breaklines were intepolated using 
the ESRI CreateTIN tool. The TIN was 
converted to a raster with a 1 Foot cell 
resolution. 

The procedure is recorded in the 
CreateFullTin model provided in the 
Tools Folder.   



Products 

The data folder includes a geodatabse 
with two feature classes holding the 
sequense of flood stage polygons.  
There are 32 polygons in this feature-
class each of them covers the full 
extent of the flood at the given stage. 

Because the river has an elevation of 1 
foot, there is no flood stage for 0.5 
feet.  These polygons are saved as 2D 
and 3D features in the FloodSimpbc 
geodatabase.  The geodatabase also 
includes each polygon as an individual 
feature class.   

A raster that represents the vanguardof  
each flood stage in plan is also included 
since it is helpful for viewing in plan. 
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